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Alerts

1 event
28 results matching for 'Corrigenda' during August 2011.

Number Title Date
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2004215120 Human antibodies specific for interleukin 15 (IL-15) 10 Aug 2011

2005221582 Tissue repair with multipotent cells 10 Aug 2011

2005230687 Synergistic attenutation of vesicular stomatitis virus, vectors thereof and immunogenic
compositions thereof

10 Aug 2011

2006201953 Header hydaulic float suspension 10 Aug 2011

2005300181 Tomato plants having higher levels of resistance to Botrytis 10 Aug 2011

2006228148 Energy-absorbing device 10 Aug 2011

2006202305 Inducing swirl in a gas flow 10 Aug 2011

2007234521 Mixing element 10 Aug 2011

2008202828 Pyrithione biocides enchanced by silver, copper, or zinc ions 10 Aug 2011

2008216983 Wireless communication components and methods for multiple system communications 10 Aug 2011

2007275955 A method and device for admixture of powder in a liquid 10 Aug 2011

2010200288 Stabiliser or recycler 10 Aug 2011

2008201621 A method for predicting the presence of haemostatic dysfunction in a patient sample 10 Aug 2011

2011100388 Improved Skateboard Wheel 10 Aug 2011

2004277455 Mixing apparatus 10 Aug 2011

2011901620 AviSmart Pty Ltd 10 Aug 2011

2011202917 Dual cycle rankine waste heat recovery cycle 10 Aug 2011

2011202749 Defrost bypass dehumidifier 10 Aug 2011

2007239102 Benzimidazole 5-sulfonamide derivatives as cannabinoid 1 (CB1) receptor ligands 10 Aug 2011

2009335010 Substituted 5,6-dihydro-6-phenylbenzo[f] isoquinolin-2-amine compounds 10 Aug 2011

2011203346 Detection of cellular stress 10 Aug 2011

2011203537 Method and apparatus of adaptively canceling a fundemental frequency of an analog signel 10 Aug 2011

2010206569 Method for increasing compressed air efficiency in a pump 10 Aug 2011

2006298715 Lignocellulosic material which is low in formaldehyde and method for the production
thereof

10 Aug 2011

2011204872 Surgical clips particularly useful in the endoluminal treatment of gastroesophageal reflux
disease (GERD)

10 Aug 2011

2004295297 Control of CO2 emissions from a Fischer-Tropsch facility by use of multiple reactors 10 Aug 2011

2008209309 A variable volume bioreactor 10 Aug 2011

2011200294 Highly absorbent pad with integrity and durability 10 Aug 2011
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Terms and Conditions
General

The information provided in this report is not in the nature of legal or other professional advice.

The information provided in this report is derived from third parties and may contain errors. You must
make your own enquiries and seek independent advice from the relevant industry professionals
regarding any information in this report.

Patents, patent applications, trademarks and trademark applications shown as lapsed or ceased may be
restored at a later date.

Disclaimer of warranty and limitation of liability

Neither IPMonitor, its affiliates nor any of their respective employees, agents, third party content
providers or licensors warrant that the information contained in this report is error free; nor do they
make any warranty as to the accuracy, reliability or content of any information in this report.

This report is provided on an "as is" basis; to the maximum extent permitted by law, IPMonitor
disclaims all representations and warranties, express or implied, with respect to any information
conatined in this report. In addition, IPMonitor does not represent or warrant that the information
contained in this report is accurate, complete or current.

This disclaimer of liability applies to any damages or injury caused by any failure of performance,
error, omission, interruption, deletion, defect, delay in operation or transmission, computer virus,
communication line failure, theft or destruction or unauthorized access to, alteration of, or use of
record, whether for breach of contract, tortious behavior, negligence, or under any other cause of
action.

Copyright

The content of this report may be protected by copyright laws and treaties around the world and all
rights relating to the same are reserved. Any paper or digital copies of this report are not to be
modified or any illustrations or any graphics used separately from any accompanying text.

Arbitration

Any dispute or difference whatsoever arising out of or in connection with this report shall be
submitted to arbitration in accordance with, and subject to, The Institute of Arbitrators & Mediators
Australia Rules for the Conduct of Commercial Arbitrations.

IPMonitor reserves the right to update the Terms and Conditions at any time without notice. Please
see the full Terms and Conditions at www.IPMonitor.com.au/trademarks/info/terms

4 of 4
www.ipmonitor.com.au


